
13th July 2020 
 
 
Freedom of Information Request - Reference No: 20201363 
 
REQUEST 
 

1. How many recorded crimes involving knives or other sharp weapons were 
there in the last 12 months?  

2. Please also provide the figure for each of the five years previous to that.  
3. During this period, how many knife crime offences were there where the 

offender(s) had not been charged because they could not be identified?  
4. In the last 12 months how many people were arrested for crimes involving a 

knife or other sharp weapon - please list by age, gender and district (e.g. 
Sheffield, Rotherham, Doncaster, Barnsley), as well as the weapon, if possible.  

5. How many weapons were seized in the last 12 months? 

CLARIFICATION 
 
South Yorkshire Police has received a number of similar requests to yours in the past. 
 
https://www.southyorkshire.police.uk/find-out/accessing-information/request-information-
under-the-freedom-of-information-act/knife-crime-ref-20200108/ 
 
https://www.southyorkshire.police.uk/find-out/accessing-information/request-information-
under-the-freedom-of-information-act/knife-crime-offences-ref-20190827/ 
 
FROM THE REQUESTER 
 
Thanks for this. The FOI Ref 20200108 provides a lot of what I need.   
 
Are you able to provide the information up to May 2020, and include the gender of 
suspects?  
 
Also, is someone able to explain why 'murder' is not listed as an offence in the 
tables? Is it possible to list the figures for this offence class?  
 
is it possible to break down by town? 
 
RESPONSE 
 
Q5 - Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 requires South Yorkshire Police, 
when refusing to provide such information (because the information is exempt), to provide 
you the applicant with a notice which:    
 

a.states that fact,  
b.specifies the exemption in question and  
c.states (if that would not otherwise be apparent) why the exemption applies. 

 
The following exemption applies to the disclosure of the information: 
 
Section 12 – Exemption where cost of compliance exceeds appropriate limit  
 
In regard to Q5, I approached a Performance Review Officer (SVCTF)  and the Administrator 
for the force property data base. 

https://www.southyorkshire.police.uk/find-out/accessing-information/request-information-under-the-freedom-of-information-act/knife-crime-ref-20200108/
https://www.southyorkshire.police.uk/find-out/accessing-information/request-information-under-the-freedom-of-information-act/knife-crime-ref-20200108/
https://www.southyorkshire.police.uk/find-out/accessing-information/request-information-under-the-freedom-of-information-act/knife-crime-offences-ref-20190827/
https://www.southyorkshire.police.uk/find-out/accessing-information/request-information-under-the-freedom-of-information-act/knife-crime-offences-ref-20190827/


 
we really only record the number of  weapons seized/recovered from our own SVCTF 
deployments- it would not be a forcewide figure.  
 

• We could look at Possession of Weapon offences and ascertain the numbers from 
there, but this may require a manual review of each offence, as I’m unsure whether 
this actually represents the number of weapons. For example, a person may be 
found in possession of several weapons, so unless it is recorded on the property tab 
of CONNECT.  Also, with possession offences, I’m unsure if the HO counting rules 
means a weapon has to be actually recovered.   For example, if it has been 
perceived to have been seen then it may not be seized as part of the offence. Of 
course it may have also been discarded by the suspect during or after the offence, 
 and so may not be seized.  

 
Again, It therefore may need a manual review of each offence. If this is required then this 
could  invoke S12 of the act as it may take over 18hrs to locate, retrieve and extract such 
data.  

 
• It also may require a search of property store systems to extract such data. For 

example, if a warrant was executed at an address where weapons may be found and 
seized, and/or disclaimed by individuals present. Each districts property database 
would have to be interrogated to find out how many fall into the category of 
‘weapons’. From past experience, it has been suggested that the type of item booked 
in is free text and not entered under pre-defined categories. So this again this may be 
a manual review process. There is also weapons to consider that may have been 
found on open land searches. These could be classed as ‘recovered’ as opposed to 
‘seized’ possibly, but they may be later linked to crimes should they be sent for 
forensics analysis.   

 
In essence, we do not record this information centrally and would take a manual review of a 
number of systems and databases to locate, extract and retrieve the data pertinent to your 
request. Even for just a 12 month period this process would take much longer than 18 hours’ 
work. 
 
 
The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulations 
2004 provide that the cost limit for non-central government public authorities is £450. This 
must be calculated at the rate of £25 per hour, providing an effective time limit of 18 hours.  
 
Guidance from the Information Commissioner to public authorities is that where one part of a 
request is reasonably estimated to exceed the appropriate limit then the authority is not 
obliged to consider or comply with the remainder of the request up to the point at which the 
appropriate limit has been reached.  Please note point 30 of the below link:- 
 
https://ico.org.uk/media/for-
organisations/documents/1199/costs_of_compliance_exceeds_appropriate_limit.pdf 

 

 
Although excess cost removes the force's obligations under the Freedom of 
Information Act, as a gesture of goodwill, I have supplied information, relative to your 
request, retrieved or available before it was realised that the fees limit would be 

https://ico.org.uk/media/for-organisations/documents/1199/costs_of_compliance_exceeds_appropriate_limit.pdf
https://ico.org.uk/media/for-organisations/documents/1199/costs_of_compliance_exceeds_appropriate_limit.pdf


exceeded. I trust this is helpful, but it does not affect our legal right to rely on the fees 
regulations for the remainder of your request neither does it bind South Yorkshire 
Police to any commitment that it will release information in such a manner in the 
future . 
 
 
I had approached the Serious Violent Crime Task Force for assistance with your request.  A 
Performance Review Officer has provided the following data and explanations: 
 
In order to maintain consistency with SYP’s knife crime figures reported to the Home Office, 
I’ve used data from our quarterly ADR 160. The return for Q1 of 2020/21 has not been 
completed yet, so the most recent 12 month period’s data available is to March 2020. Please 
see my responses interleaved below: 
 
1. How many recorded crimes involving knives or other sharp weapons were there in 

the last 12 months?  

Our ADR 160 (Knife Crime) return to the Home Office for financial year 2019/20 showed a 
figure of 969 offences. 
 
2. Please also provide the figure for each of the five years previous to that.  

2014/15:  519 
2015/16:  587 
2016/17:  874 
2017/18:  1,006 
2018/19:  1,024 
 
3. During this period, how many knife crime offences were there where the 

offender(s) had not been charged because they could not be identified?  

I think this question is open to interpretation on the grounds that some offences within the 
last 12 months are still ongoing, so whilst the requester is most likely interested in offences 
with Outcomes 14 or 18, it could be argued that an offence with no outcome has not yet 
identified a suspect who could be charged. I have therefore broken down all of the outcomes 
for the 969 offences, allowing the requester to apply whichever interpretation they prefer: 
 
Outcome Offences 
01 - Charged/Summonsed 140 
01A - Charge/Summons- Alternative Offence 35 
02 - Youth Conditional Caution 1 
03 - Adult Caution – simple 3 
08 - Community resolution (with or without Restorative Justice) (Crime) 5 
11 - Prosecution Prevented-Named Suspect Identified But Is Below The Age Of 
Criminal Responsibility 1 
12 - Prosecution Prevented-Named Suspect Identified But Is Too Ill (Physical Or 
Mental Health) To Prosecute 5 
13 - Prosecution Prevented-Named Suspect Identified But Victim Or Key 
Witness Is Dead Or Too Ill To Give Evidence 1 
14 - Evidential Difficulties Victim Based- Suspect Not Identified: Crime 
Confirmed But The Victim Either Declines Or Unable To Support Further Police 
Investigation To Identify The Offender 147 



15 - Named  Suspect Identified: Victim Supports Police Action But Evidential 
Difficulties Prevent Further Action (CPS and or Police decision) 87 
16 - Named Suspect Identified: Evidential Difficulties Prevent Further Action: 
Victim Does Not Support (Or Has Withdrawn Support From) Police Action 197 
18 - Investigation Complete; No Suspect Identified. Crime Investigated As Far 
As Reasonably Possible-Case Closed Pending Further Investigative 
Opportunities Becoming Available 259 
20 - Dealt with by Partner Agency 10 
22 - Named Suspect Diversionary, educational or intervention activity, resulting 
from the crime report, has been undertaken and it is not in the public interest to 
take any further action 9 
Not Recorded (Investigation ongoing) 69 
Grand Total 969 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


